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MODERATOR: Talk about the renovation and how it looks out there.  
 
QUIGLEY: It all looks fantastic. I mean the golf course is in perfect condition. The 
greens are going to be more of a challenge this year. It's perfect. The greens are 
challenging. Greens are challenging. The course is good. It's playing longer. I think it will 
hold on with the win. I think it will be a good challenge all week.  
 
MODERATOR: In the month of October you won Furyk and Friends, finished third at 
Dominion. You got to feel good about the way you're playing.  
 
QUIGLEY: I'm happy with my game. You never know who's showing up. I'm very happy 
with how I'm playing and where I am right now. I'm looking forward to this weekend.  
 
QUESTION: When you're on a roll like this, what is it like? How do you try and keep 
things going when you're playing well? Try to stay out of my own way. Probably for me, 
you manage expectations. Not try to predict what the future is going to be and not try to 
birdie every hole and just go play golf.  
 
That's always, I think, been my challenge. But I'm playing nice, so if I continue that, I 
think it will be a couple of good weeks.  
 
QUESTION: Will this be an emotional week for you?  
 
QUIGLEY: No, no, no. I'm sure it will come and go. Even when talking to Dana this 
morning and coming down, I know I'll get emotional. I bet it will be different times of the 
day, different times during the round. It'll be a good thing. It'll be a great thing.  
01:40 I know there'll be a lot of love there.  
 
QUESTION: What has been working? What has been the difference lately? It's a little 
bit of everything. There's nothing to me that stands out. I'd say maybe my attitude is a 
little better as far as patient with myself.  
 
Like I said, I think it's just being, just playing golf. I mean, when I do that, I can score, 
okay, and get near the near the lead. So I mean, that's our challenge every week.  
 
This is guys guys typically putt well when they're playing well, but just being in the right 
mindset. 



 
QUESTION: You know, when people go through difficult situations, sports is a, I guess 
a diversion or, you know, you're able to pick your mind up for things.  
02:32 Is that and how this is being at your profession? Has that been kind of the case 
this week? Have you been able to at least?  
 
QUIGLEY: Yeah, I try to emulate Rod Pamplin who really does a nice job of that every 
week. So he's probably been my mentor the last couple of weeks.  
 
QUESTION: What other guys kind of tried to say to message to you this week?  
 
QUIGLEY: It's been positive. I know, and I know, you know, this, not everybody knows 
what to say or how to approach. I just say, you know, thanks and there's nothing but 
love there.  
 
I know it's been a difficult time for Dana, Angie, Charlotte, Nicole and everybody 
immediately involved. But there's nothing but love.  
 
QUESTION: Last time I got World Champions Cup is in December. What do you know 
about that event? And if you were selected, what would that mean to you?  
 
QUIGLEY: It would mean the world. I mean, honestly, it would be an honor. I know 
there's a couple guys that are maybe playing and might not play. But I told, I've told 
everyone involved, even if it's the day of, I don't live that far away. I will drive and get 
there for the tournament being the challenge. I would, that would love that very much.  
 


